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Dear Sir or Madam, 
 
Proposed residents’ parking scheme – Goodfellow Way and Hewitt Road, Dover 
 
Following our previous letter to you, we have been made aware that there has been some 
confusion regarding the Scheme, and I do apologise for any concerns you may have had.  
We are now giving you a further opportunity to respond.   
 
We are aware that non-residents regularly park along the roads in your neighbourhood and, 
of those, most of them stay for the full working day or park in the evenings reducing parking 
availability for the residents.  One possible way to address this problem that has been 
suggested by some residents would be to introduce a “residents only” parking scheme into 
both areas; these will respectively be known as Zone S for Goodfellow Way and Zone T for 
Hewitt Road. 
 
I am therefore writing to enquire whether, you would support the introduction of a “residents 
only’ parking scheme in your road? 
 
Please find enclosed a plan showing the extent of the residential parking schemes Zone S & 
Zone T being proposed for your areas.  The schemes, if progressed, would involve 
introducing permits for all residents.  Households within the zones can apply for up to 2 
annual permits per household; the cost of the permits are now based on the emission level 
of a vehicle and are shown below.  The purchase of a permit does not guarantee the 
availability of parking spaces. You would not be eligible to park in either Zone, just the Zone 
specific to your address, i.e. Zone S for Goodfellow Way residents and Zone T for Hewitt 
Road residents.  
 
Residents are also permitted to purchase Visitor Tickets for guests, which will allow your 
guests to park in the “residents only” areas of Goodfellow Way or Hewitt Road.  These 
currently cost £22.00 for a book of 10 tickets.  However, from 1st April 2021, these will cost 
£30 for a book of 10.  One has to be given to each guest for them to display in their car 
during their visit to you.  For residents with more than one vehicle per household, you can 
have 2 vehicles on the one permit, but only one vehicle at a time can be active on the permit, 
but you can swap between vehicles depending which vehicle is required to park.  Where two 
registration numbers are required on the one permit, the cost for the second vehicle will be 
based on the vehicle with the highest emissions.   
 
 
 
 
 
 

Appendix B 



If the majority of responders support the proposed schemes, agreement will be sought from 
Councillor’s on the Dover Joint Transportation Advisory Board (JTAB) to formally advertise 
the proposal. Conversely, if the majority of responders’ object, it is likely that the JTAB will 
abandon the proposal.  Alternatively, if all but one or two roads support the scheme, it’s 
possible that a variant scheme could be considered that excludes those roads where the 
majority of responders objected.   
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
Ms. R. Hafizi 
Transport and Parking Services Manager 
 
 
Charges to be based on vehicle emissions, first vehicle cost: 
 
 C02:  0: £35 
 1-50: £70 
 51-130: £90 
 >130: £110 

Charges to be based on vehicle emissions, second vehicle cost: 
 
C02:  0: £60 
 1-50: £85 
 51-130: £115 
 >130: £135 

 

 
 
 


